

Ductile Iron Pipe and Fittings
Invitation to Bid (ITB) # 2205
Augusta County Service Authority
Thursday, April 28, 2022
2:00 PM
Opened By: Casey McCracken
Witness: Jesse Roach

BID TABULATION

			LB Water Service Inc		Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co.		Core & Main		Ferguson Enterprises, LLC		Fortiline, Inc	
Bid Bond			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
Addendum 1			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
Material	Unit	Quantity	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
12" Class 52 DI Slip Joint Pipe	LF	14,000	\$ 69.28	\$ 969,920.00	\$ 67.86	\$ 950,040.00	\$ 64.36	\$ 901,040.00	\$ 75.57	\$ 1,057,980.00	\$ 78.84	\$ 1,103,760.00
6" Class 52 DI Slip Joint Pipe	LF	340	\$ 29.75	\$ 10,115.00	\$ 29.13	\$ 9,904.20	\$ 27.77	\$ 9,441.80	\$ 32.44	\$ 11,029.60	\$ 29.43	\$ 10,006.20
24" Steel Casing with 0.5" wall thickness (20' lengths)	LF	180	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 169.00	\$ 30,420.00	\$ 105.30	\$ 18,954.00	\$ 122.95	\$ 22,131.00	\$ 153.44	\$ 27,619.20
24" x 12" SS Casing Spiders	EA	28	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 140.00	\$ 3,920.00	\$ 140.59	\$ 3,936.52	\$ 119.57	\$ 3,347.96	\$ 121.25	\$ 3,395.00
24" x 12" Casing End Seals with accessories	EA	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 62.50	\$ 375.00	\$ 126.48	\$ 758.88	\$ 65.22	\$ 391.32	\$ 72.84	\$ 437.04
5.25" Fire Hydrant with 3.5' bury depth	EA	17	\$ 2,518.90	\$ 42,821.30	\$ 2,661.61	\$ 45,247.37	\$ 2,430.66	\$ 41,321.22	\$ 2,867.30	\$ 48,744.10	\$ 3,242.71	\$ 55,126.07
12" DI MJ Gate Valve - OL	EA	26	\$ 2,518.90	\$ 65,491.40	\$ 2,444.00	\$ 63,544.00	\$ 2,366.36	\$ 61,525.36	\$ 2,881.63	\$ 74,922.38	\$ 3,256.40	\$ 84,666.40
12" DI MJ Long Sleeve	EA	5	\$ 234.85	\$ 1,174.25	\$ 247.20	\$ 1,236.00	\$ 247.87	\$ 1,239.35	\$ 253.50	\$ 1,267.50	\$ 290.00	\$ 1,450.00
12" DI MJ 11.25 Degree Bend	EA	22	\$ 208.90	\$ 4,595.80	\$ 220.00	\$ 4,840.00	\$ 220.49	\$ 4,850.78	\$ 225.50	\$ 4,961.00	\$ 257.97	\$ 5,675.34
12" DI MJ 22.5 Degree Bend	EA	6	\$ 222.80	\$ 1,336.80	\$ 234.50	\$ 1,407.00	\$ 235.16	\$ 1,410.96	\$ 240.50	\$ 1,443.00	\$ 275.13	\$ 1,650.78
12" DI MJ 45 Degree Bend	EA	7	\$ 254.75	\$ 1,783.25	\$ 274.27	\$ 1,919.89	\$ 268.89	\$ 1,882.23	\$ 275.00	\$ 1,925.00	\$ 314.60	\$ 2,202.20
12" DI MJ Tee	EA	2	\$ 428.00	\$ 856.00	\$ 450.53	\$ 901.06	\$ 451.74	\$ 903.48	\$ 462.00	\$ 924.00	\$ 528.52	\$ 1,057.04
12" x 6" DI MJ Tee	EA	17	\$ 290.40	\$ 4,936.80	\$ 305.72	\$ 5,197.24	\$ 306.54	\$ 5,211.18	\$ 313.50	\$ 5,329.50	\$ 358.64	\$ 6,096.88
12" Restraint Gaskets - for DI push joint pipe	EA	180	\$ 169.71	\$ 30,547.80	\$ 178.66	\$ 32,158.80	\$ 206.00	\$ 37,080.00	\$ 175.24	\$ 31,543.20	\$ 201.53	\$ 36,275.40
12" DI MJ Megalugs	EA	180	\$ 121.05	\$ 21,789.00	\$ 130.18	\$ 23,432.40	\$ 131.42	\$ 23,655.60	\$ 116.29	\$ 20,932.20	\$ 146.21	\$ 26,317.80
12" x 10" DI MJ Reducer	EA	2	\$ 162.15	\$ 324.30	\$ 174.00	\$ 348.00	\$ 171.12	\$ 342.24	\$ 175.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 200.20	\$ 400.40
6" DI MJ Gate Valve - OL	EA	17	\$ 801.55	\$ 13,626.35	\$ 777.60	\$ 13,219.20	\$ 753.83	\$ 12,815.11	\$ 917.05	\$ 15,589.85	\$ 1,036.32	\$ 17,617.44
6" DI MJ Megalugs	EA	70	\$ 46.50	\$ 3,255.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 50.72	\$ 3,550.40	\$ 44.65	\$ 3,125.50	\$ 58.77	\$ 4,113.90
Slip Style Valve Boxes 24" - 36" range	EA	43	\$ 88.70	\$ 3,814.10	\$ 81.00	\$ 3,483.00	\$ 99.11	\$ 4,261.73	\$ 55.86	\$ 2,401.98	\$ 87.50	\$ 3,762.50
Grand Total				\$ 1,176,387.15		\$ 1,195,093.16		\$ 1,134,180.84		\$ 1,308,339.09		\$ 1,391,629.59

Variance from Bid Sheet
Disqualified As Non-Responsive
Apparent Low